
Social Sector Hotline

July 06, 2022

NOT-FOR-PROFITS REJOICE: RECEIVING FOREIGN CONTRIBUTIONS MADE EASY

 

The Foreign Contribution (Regulation) Rules 2011 (“2011 Rules”) has been amended by The Foreign Contribution

(Regulation) Amendment Rules, 2022; enforced from July 1, 2022.

Persons/associations can receive up to 10 lakh INR (approx. $13000) and a time of three months to declare if the

same exceeds the prescribed limit.

Registered entities are not required to furnish intimation of quarterly receipt of foreign contribution

The time limit for intimating change of names, aims, objectives or key members of the association has been

increased to 45 days.

The maximum fine for receiving a foreign contribution without being registered or receiving prior consent has

increased from 10% to 30%.

I N T R O D U C T I O N          

The Foreign Contribution (Regulation) Rules 2011 (“2011 Rules”) has been amended by The Foreign Contribution

(Regulation) Amendment Rules, 2022 (“New Rules”)1 which came into effect on July 1st, 2022. The Government in

its powers conferred under Section 48 of Foreign Contribution (Regulation) Act, 2010 (“FCRA”) has amended the

rules under this Act for carrying out its provisions.

FCRA regulates foreign donations and ensures that such contributions do not adversely affect the internal security of

the country. The provisions of the Act apply to the territory of India, to citizens of India who may be outside India and

to companies or their branches outside India that are registered or incorporated in India. The entities covered by the

Act include an individual, a Hindu undivided family, an association, or a registered company.

K E Y  A M E N D M E N T S  A N D  T H E I R  I M P A C T                             

RULE AMENDMENTS IMPACT

Rule 6 -
Intimation of
receiving foreign
contribution
from relatives

“In the Foreign Contribution (Regulation) Rules, 2011
(hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in rule 6, —

(i) for the words “one lakh rupees”, the words “ten lakh
rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words “thirty days”, the words “three months”
shall be substituted;”

Persons/associations can receive

up to 10 lakh INR (roughly $13000

equivalent) and a time of three

months to declare the same under

Form FC-1 if the same exceeds the

prescribed limit.

Rule 9 -
Application for
obtaining
'registration' or
'prior
permission' to
receive foreign
contribution.

“In the said rules, in rule 9,

(i) in sub-rule (1), in clause (e), for the words “fifteen
days”, the words “forty-five days” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-rule (2), in clause (e), for the words “fifteen
days”, the words “forty five days” shall be substituted;”

FCRA Registered

persons/associations (previously or

presently) must submit Form FC-6D

within 45 days.

Rule 13 -
Declaration of
receipt of
foreign
contribution.

“Declaration of receipt of foreign contribution. - (a)
…….

(b) Omitted”

Registered entities are not required

to furnish intimation of quarterly

receipt of foreign contribution.

Rule 17A -
Change of
designated bank
account, name,

“In the said rules, in rule 17A, for the words “fifteen days”,
the words “forty-five days” shall be substituted;”

The time limit for intimating changes

under Forms FC-6A, FC-6B, FC-6C,

FC-6D or FC-6E is increased to 45

days.

Research Papers

Mergers & Acquisitions
July 11, 2025

New Age of Franchising
June 20, 2025

Life Sciences 2025
June 11, 2025

Research Articles

2025 Watchlist: Life Sciences
Sector India
April 04, 2025

Re-Evaluating Press Note 3 Of 2020:
Should India’s Land Borders Still
Define Foreign Investment
Boundaries?
February 04, 2025

INDIA 2025: The Emerging
Powerhouse for Private Equity and
M&A Deals
January 15, 2025

Audio

CCI’s Deal Value Test
February 22, 2025

Securities Market Regulator’s
Continued Quest Against
“Unfiltered” Financial Advice
December 18, 2024

Digital Lending - Part 1 - What's New
with NBFC P2Ps
November 19, 2024

NDA Connect

Connect with us at events,  

conferences and seminars.

NDA Hotline

Click here to view Hotline archives.

Video

Reimagining CSR: From Grant Giving
to Blended Finance & Outcome
Based Funding
June 16, 2025

Courts vs Bankruptcy code: The

/fileadmin/user_upload/pdfs/Research_Papers/Mergers___Acquisitions_in_India.pdf
https://www.nishithdesai.com/fileadmin/user_upload/pdfs/Research_Papers/New-Age-of-Franchising.pdf
/fileadmin/user_upload/pdfs/Research_Papers/Life-Sciences-2025.pdf
https://www.nishithradio.com/Podcast.aspx?id=137&title=CCI%E2%80%99s_Deal_Value_Test
https://www.nishithradio.com/Podcast.aspx?id=126&title=Securities_Market_Regulator%E2%80%99s_Continued_Quest_Against_%E2%80%9CUnfiltered%E2%80%9D_Financial_Advice
https://www.nishithradio.com/Podcast.aspx?id=123&title=Digital_Lending_-_Part_1_-_What%27s_New_with_NBFC_P2Ps
/Event/1.html?EventType=Upcoming
/Event/1.html?EventType=Upcoming
SectionCategory/33/Research-and-Articles/12/0/NDAHotline/1.html
https://www.nishith.tv/videos/reimagining-csr-from-grant-giving-to-blended-finance-outcome-based-funding-june-16-2025/
https://www.nishith.tv/videos/courts-vs-bankruptcy-code-the-jsw-bhushan-saga/


address, aims,
objectives or
Key members of
the association.

Rule 20 -
Revision of an
order passed by
the competent
authority under
Section 32 of the
Act

“In the said rules, in rule 20, for the words “on a plain
paper”, the words “in such form and manner, including in
electronic form as may be specified by the Central
Government” shall be substituted.”

Application for revision of an Order

cannot be made on “a plain paper”.

It must be filed in the prescribed

format electronically.

Table 1: Denoting the 2022 amendments in the governing rules and their impact

K E Y  A M E N D M E N T S  I N  C O M P O U N D I N G  O F  O F F E N C E S  U N D E R  F C R A ,  2 0 1 0                                                        

The Central Government2 further revised the penalty payable in case of compounding of offences under FCRA. The

maximum fine for receiving a foreign contribution without being registered or receiving prior consent has increased

from 10% to 30%. Though the minimum fine remains at INR 1 lakh (approx. $1300) it has not altered. The offence of

sub-granting or transferring FCRA money to any other person may only be compounded once.

The following table shows the offences which are compoundable under FCRA along with the penalties for

contravention of the provisions of FCRA:

S.No. Offence Amount of Penalty Officer competent for
Compounding

1 Offence punishable under Section 35 for

accepting any hospitality in contravention

of Section 6 (Intimation of receiving foreign

contribution from relatives).

INR 10,000 ($130) Director/Deputy Secretary in-

charge

2 Offence punishable under Section 37 for

transferring any foreign contribution to any

other person in contravention of Section 7

of the Act or any rule made thereunder:

Provided that transfer of foreign

contribution (inclusive of more than one

instances of transfer, if any) shall be

compoundable only once.

INR 1 Lakh ($1300) or ten

percent (10%) of such

transferred foreign

contribution, whichever is

higher.

Director/Deputy Secretary in-

charge

3 Offence punishable under Section 37 for

defraying of foreign contribution beyond

twenty per cent of the contribution received

for administrative expenses in

contravention of Section 8 of the Act.

INR 1 Lakh ($1300) or five

percent (5%) of such foreign

contribution so defrayed

beyond the permissible limit,

whichever is higher

Director/Deputy Secretary in-

charge

4 Offence punishable under Section 35 for

accepting foreign contribution in

contravention of Section 11(mandatory

registration or prior permission from the

Central Government before receiving

foreign contribution).

INR 1 Lakh ($1300) or thirty

percent (30%) of the foreign

contribution received,

whichever is higher

Director/Deputy Secretary in-

charge

5 Offences punishable under Section 37

read with Section 17 of the Act for-

(a) receiving foreign contribution in any

account other than specified account in his

application for grant of certificate;

(b) non-reporting the prescribed amount of

foreign remittance or source and manner

of such remittance by banks and

authorised persons.

(c) receiving and depositing any fund other

than foreign contribution in the account or

accounts opened for receiving foreign

contribution or for utilising the foreign

contribution.

INR 1 Lakh ($1300) or five

percent (5%) of the foreign

contribution received in such

account, whichever is higher;

INR 1 Lakh ($1300) or three

percent (3%) of the foreign

contribution received or

deposited in such account,

whichever is higher.

INR 1 Lakh ($1300) or two

percent (2%) of such deposit,

whichever is higher.

Director/Deputy Secretary in-

charge

6 Offence punishable under Section 37 for

non-furnishing of intimation of the amount

of each foreign contribution received and

the source from which and in the manner

INR 1 Lakh ($1300) or five

percent (5%) of the foreign

contribution received during

the period of non-

Director/Deputy Secretary in-

charge

JSW-Bhushan Saga
June 04, 2025

Vyapak Desai speaking on the
danger of deepfakes | Legally
Speaking with Tarun Nangia |
NewsX
April 01, 2025

https://www.nishith.tv/videos/vyapak-desai-speaking-on-the-danger-of-deepfakes-legally-speaking-with-tarun-nangia-newsx/


in which, such foreign contribution is

received as required under Section 18 of

the Act.

submission, whichever is

higher.

7 Offence punishable under Section 37 for

not maintaining the account and records of

foreign contribution received and manner

of its utilisation as required Section 19 of

the Act.

INR 1 Lakh ($1300) or five

percent (5%) of the foreign

contribution during the

relevant period of non-

maintenance of accounts,

whichever is higher.

Director/Deputy Secretary in-

charge

8 Offence punishable under Sections 3, 11

and 35 of the Act read with rule 6 for failure

to intimate about receipt of foreign

contribution within the prescribed time

limit.

Five per cent (5%) of such

foreign contribution received

in a financial year

Director/Deputy Secretary in

charge

9 Offence punishable under Section 37,

Section 17 and Section 19 of the Act read

with clause (e) of sub-rule (1) of rule 9 for

failure to intimate about opening of

account or accounts within the prescribed

time.

INR 10,000 ($130) per

utilisation account for failure

to intimate within the

prescribed time.

Director/Deputy Secretary in

charge

10 Offence punishable under Section 37,

Section 17 and Section 19 of the Act read

with clause (e) of sub-rule (2) of rule 9 for

failure to intimate about opening of

account or accounts within the prescribed

time.

INR 10,000 ($130) per

utilisation account for failure

to intimate within the

prescribed time.

Director/Deputy Secretary in

charge

11 Offence punishable under Section 37,

Section 11 and Section 17 of the Act read

with rule 17A, for failure to intimate about

details within the prescribed time

INR 10,000 ($130) or thirty

per cent (30%) for each

violation of failure to intimate

within the prescribed time

Director/Deputy Secretary in-

charge

12 Offence punishable under Section 37 and

Section 19 of the Act read with rule 13, for

failure to place on website as prescribed in

clause (a) of rule 13 within the prescribed

time.

INR 10,000 ($130) for each

violation.

Director/Deputy Secretary in-

charge

Table No. 2: Denoting the list of amended compoundable offences and subsequent penalties thereof

C O N C L U S I O N        

The 2022 amendments allow for significant increase in quantum of permissible foreign contributions. This allows for

persons/associations to receive more foreign contributions in a smoother manner; and reduces time and

management resources spent in regulatory procedures. Additions in the list of compoundable offences is an initial

step to encourage foreign contributions in India. The FCRR aims at prohibiting utilisation of foreign contribution for

any activities detrimental to the national interest. Nevertheless, the government, while ensuring strict scrutiny of all

foreign contributions to India, has significantly smoothened the procedure and the penalty for any lapses therein to

ensure that the same does not discourage the rate of foreign contributions.

Thereby, as per the amended rules, person’s/associations barred to receive foreign contribution under Section 3,

FCRA can receive foreign contribution up to INR 10 lakh ($13000). Entities can pay five percent (5%) of the foreign

contribution received and absolve their liability under FCRA. Mandatory disclosures of quarterly updates on the

foreign contribution received are no longer required.

With reference to amendments to compoundable offences, the amount of penalty computed with respect to any

offence(s) thereof shall not be more than the value of the foreign contribution received. Lastly, the application to

compound offences specified above may be processed in physical or electronic form as may be specified by the

Government.

The new amendments will lead positive implications for not-for-profits receiving foreign contributions in India. The

compliance burden has significantly reduced to allow them to structure their resources and time for utilizing their

foreign contributions. The entities shall not be required to report receiving any amount lesser than INR ten lakhs

($13000). Moreover, in case of any contraventions falling under the list of compoundable offences, the penalty

imposed upon the entities has also been reduced. Thereby, aiding not-for-profits in accepting foreign contributions

without any bureaucratic or legal, regulatory delays.

– Nitish Raj, Rahul Rishi & Dr.Milind Antani

(The authors would like to thank Ms. Shhreiya Agarawal and Ms. Aanchal Singh for their contribution to this hotline.)

You can direct your queries or comments to the authors

1 Notification No. GSR 506(E) dated 01.07.2022 in F. No. II/21022/23(04)/2021-FCRA-III:

mailto:nitish.raj@nishithdesai.com
mailto:rahul.rishi@nishithdesai.com
mailto:milind.antani@nishithdesai.com


https://egazette.nic.in/WriteReadData/2022/236981.pdf

2 Notification S.O.3025(E) dated 01.07.2022 in F. No. II/21022/23 (04)/2021-FCRA-III:

https://egazette.nic.in/WriteReadData/2022/236966.pdf

DISCLAIMER

The contents of this hotline should not be construed as legal opinion. View detailed disclaimer.

This Hotline provides general information existing at the time of
preparation. The Hotline is intended as a news update and
Nishith Desai Associates neither assumes nor accepts any
responsibility for any loss arising to any person acting or
refraining from acting as a result of any material contained in this
Hotline. It is recommended that professional advice be taken
based on the specific facts and circumstances. This Hotline does
not substitute the need to refer to the original pronouncements.

This is not a Spam mail. You have received this mail because you
have either requested for it or someone must have suggested your
name. Since India has no anti-spamming law, we refer to the US
directive, which states that a mail cannot be considered Spam if it
contains the sender's contact information, which this mail does. In
case this mail doesn't concern you, please unsubscribe from mailing
list.

https://egazette.nic.in/WriteReadData/2022/236981.pdf
https://egazette.nic.in/WriteReadData/2022/236966.pdf

	Social Sector Hotline
	Research Papers
	NOT-FOR-PROFITS REJOICE: RECEIVING FOREIGN CONTRIBUTIONS MADE EASY

	Research Articles
	INTRODUCTION

	Audio
	KEY AMENDMENTS AND THEIR IMPACT

	NDA Connect
	NDA Hotline
	Video
	KEY AMENDMENTS IN COMPOUNDING OF OFFENCES UNDER FCRA, 2010
	CONCLUSION
	DISCLAIMER


